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Global Public Health 2021 invites all the participants from all 
over the world to attend the "7th Global Public Health, 
Occupational Safety and Health Policy" conference during 
July 12-13, as a Webinar. This global conference includes 
prompt keynote presentations, Oral talks, Poster 
presentations and Exhibitions. 

The conference runs with the theme “Prevention is better 
than cure” that melds brief keynote presentations, speaker 
talks, Exhibition, Symposia, and Workshops. 

Global Public Health 2021 Webinar is being hosted and 
organized by Conference Series LLC Ltd. On July 12-13, 
2021.Conference Series LLC LTD organizes more than 3000+ 
global events with 600+ conferences 1000+ symposiums and 
1200+ workshops in Europe, Asia and USA along the peer 
reviewing journals which contains over 20000+ eminent 
personalities, scientist as reputed Editorial Board Members.  

Global Public Health 2021 is an international forum for 
Academicians, Public health specialists, Health professionals, 
Healthcare providers, Researches, Scientists, Policy makers, 
Pharmaceutical developers, and health workers to present 
their latest research ideas, development and applications in 
all areas of Global Public Health. 

Exchange ideas and network with leading Neurologist, 
Cardiologist, Pediatrician’s, Gynecologists, Epidemiologist, 
Dentist, Microbiologists, Dermatologist, Psychiatrist, 
Nutrition’s, Healthcare Management, public health 
professionals and researchers, Scientists from more than 40 
countries. 

Global Public Health 2021 Conference also covers broad 
subject matter expertise in Global Public Health, Adolescent 
Health, Mental Health and Mental Disorders, Infectious 
Diseases, Addiction disorders,  Epidemiology and Public 
Health, Long-term care, Research methods, Clinical 
microbiology, Patient safety and quality, Implementation 
science, Prevention methods, and networking and 
communication. 

There is increasing emphasis on the concept of value within 
the world of healthcare. Currently, there is no single means 

of accurately determining a Nutritionist Value. It remains 
critical for all public health Professionals to understand the 
essential regulatory and administrative principles.  

This Public Health Conference aims to unite eminent 
scientists, research scholars, Health Care Professionals, and 
Nutritional Experts to share their views on the latest 
technologies, trends and concerns in Health Care and 
Current advancements. It focuses on addressing the 
continuous effort being made by scientists and scholars to 
improve the existing and inventing new technologies in this 
modern era. 

Our Europe Conferences are composed of well-organized 
scientific sessions, Plenary presentations, Keynote speeches, 
Breast Cancer Expert Meetings, Oral presentations, Poster 
Presentations, e-Poster Presentation, Industrial 
Presentations, Panel Discussions, B2B Meetings, Young 
Researcher Forums (YRF), International workshops, Exhibitor 
Presentations, Sponsor interactions, International 
Symposiums etc. The Global Public Health conference is an 
international podium, which encourages the young 
researchers by felicitating them with the Young Researcher/ 
Young Scientist awards. 

Conference Highlights: 

 Poster presentations by Young Researchers 

 Keynote forums by Prominent Professors, Doctors 

 Open Innovation Challenges 

 Lectures from renowned speakers 

 Innovative techniques to benefit your research 

 Global Networking sessions with 60+ Countries 

Target Audience 

 CEO’s of Healthcare agencies, Directors of 

Association and Societies 

 Health care Professionals 

 Deans and Lecturers 

 Nutritionists 

 Public Health Professionals 

 Medical students  

 

 
 

 

 

 

Corresponding Author: Suresh Vatsyayan  freegp@gmail.com   Professor, Waikato University, New Zealand. 

Citation: Suresh Vatsyayan. 7th Global Public Health, Occupational Safety and Health Policy. J Environ Occup Health. 2021; 11(4):54 

Copyrights: © 2021 The Authors. This is an open access article under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution NonCommercial ShareAlike 4.0 
(https://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc-sa/4.0/). 

https://globalpublichealth.healthconferences.org/
https://globalpublichealth.healthconferences.org/
https://globalpublichealth.healthconferences.org/
https://globalpublichealth.healthconferences.org/
mailto:freegp@gmail.com

